
WITH PERMIT PERMITLESS
You can carry concealed weapons in 
Missouri plus 36 other states.

You can only carry in Missouri.

Firearms safety and legal training 
required.

No training required.

You can carry in school zones to drop 
off, pick up, or go to sporting events or 
meetings inside the school as long as 
the gun remains locked in the car.

If you carry a firearm within a thousand 
feet of a school or school sponsored 
event, you are in violation of the Federal 
Gun Free School Zone Act.

If you are caught carrying in any of the 
17 places listed in 571.107 of the 
Missouri Revised Statutes, you must be 
asked to leave, and refuse to leave, 
before you can be cited with an 
infraction (not a criminal offense) and 
fined $100.

If you are caught carrying in the 17 
places listed, you can be arrested and 
charged with a class B misdemeanor 
weapons offense.

You will have a good working 
knowledge of RSMo 571 (Missouri 
weapons and ccw law) and RSMo 563 
(when you are justified in using self 
defense).

You're on your own.

You have the legal knowledge that you 
can only use your handgun when your 
life or that of an innocent other is at risk 
of serious physical injury or death.

You do not know the very limited times 
you can use your handgun.

Cost of training is $125, plus the ccw 
permit from the sheriff which costs no 
more than $100.

Cost of using your handgun and making 
a mistake?  Everything you own plus 
the possibility of you in jail.

Considering Permitless Carry?
Here's a comparison of your Right to Carry with and without a permit!


